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Perfect, thanks so much for this quick followup! 

Magnhild

On Monday, February 13, 2017, Marianne Ose Askvik <Marianne.Ose.Askvik@hfk.no> wrote:

Hi Magnhild and Cameron,

 

Thank you for your e-mail. In the space for “tilsegnsum” you write 450 000 NOK. Usually, there would be
paid out 150 000 NOK because this is a 3-year KUP-project. But each KUP-recipient can apply for
“irregular” KUP-payments during the project period. We cannot pay more than 90 % of the total amount.
This is because the last 10% (45 000 NOK) will be paid when we have received the final report and final
accounts for the KUP-project. Since this KUP-grant for 3 years, the last 10% will be paid in 2019. 

 

When we have received your acceptance form (Akseptskjema), we will make a transfer of 405 000 NOK.

 

You have to fill out the reporting form (rapporteringsskjema) every year, and you can use attached template
for this.

 

The letter of notification (Tilsegnbrev) was signed 20.10.2016, so you can write this date on “tilsegnsbrev
datert”. This letter was sent through our archivesystem as a “flettebrev” through Altinn – have you checked
it? But I have also attached the template for this letter. Your unique information is not written there, because
of the “flettebrev”-function. But all the other information is relevant for all KUP-recipients.

 

Congratulations on your pregnancy, Magnhild! I wish you all the best for your maternity leave.

 

Best regards,

 

Marianne Ose Askvik

Spesialrådgjevar

Kultur- og idrettsavdelinga | Seksjon for kunst- og kulturformidling

 

Tlf: 55 23 95 43 
www.hordaland.no



 

Fra: magnhild øen nordahl [mailto:magnhildnordahl@gmail.com] 
Sendt: 13. februar 2017 09:59
Til: Marianne Ose Askvik <Marianne.Ose.Askvik@hfk.no>
Kopi: Cameron MacLeod <cameron.mac@gmail.com>
Emne: Re: Oppdatert informasjon på tildelingsbrev

 

Hi Marianne,

I reply in english to keep Cameron in the loop. Thanks for the reply and explanations!

We would like to ask for the whole amount at once, so we then write 450.000 in the space for "tilsegnsum", is this
how we do that? And then we don't use this report form now, only at the end of the project period before receiving
the last 10%, is that correct?

Also the form asks for a date on the "tilsegnsbrev". Actually we never received this letter from KUP funding, only
from Kulturbygg med regionale funksjoner which we received on 02.10.2016. We found out about the support on a
list online, "Saksprotokoll i utval for kultur, idrett og regional utvikling - 14.09.2016". Can we just use this date?
Would you mind sending us a copy of the KUP tilsegnsbrev?

I'm going on maternity leave in one month from now so most of the communication from now on will be with
Cameron.

Thanks very much!

Best regards

Magnhild/Cameron

Aldea

 

 

2017-02-08 14:15 GMT+01:00 Marianne Ose Askvik <Marianne.Ose.Askvik@hfk.no>:

Hei Magnhild,

 

Takk for fint møte før jul! Og takk for epost.  

 

Vedlagt er akseptskjema som de signerer og returnerer som ei stadfesting på at de har akseptert vilkåra
for løyvinga.

 

Når det gjeld spørsmålet om utbetaling så vert fyrste delutbetaling gjennomført snarleg etter vi har motteke
dykkar stadfesting. Dykkar prosjekt har fått KUP-støtte for 3 år og dei neste utbetalingane vert gjennomført
etter at årlege statusrapportar er sendt inn. Mal for rapportering er lagt ved i denne epost. Siste 10% av
totalsum vert utbetalt når det ligg føre sluttrapport og –rekneskap.



 

Som vi nemnte på møtet før jul, så er det høve for å be om ujamne utbetalingar i prosjektperioden. Om de
ikkje ber om dette, vil fyrste delutbetaling vere på 150 000 kroner.

 

Vennleg helsing

 

Marianne Ose Askvik

Spesialrådgjevar

Kultur- og idrettsavdelinga | Seksjon for kunst- og kulturformidling

 

Tlf: 55 23 95 43 
www.hordaland.no

 

Fra: magnhild øen nordahl [mailto:magnhildnordahl@gmail.com] 
Sendt: 6. februar 2017 10:53
Til: Ronny Skaar <Ronny.Skaar@hfk.no>; Marianne Ose Askvik <Marianne.Ose.Askvik@hfk.no>
Emne: Oppdatert informasjon på tildelingsbrev

 

Hei Marianne og Ronny,

Viser til telefonsamtale med Ronny Skaar. 

Som vi skreiv i søknader til HFK i 2016 har vi starta en ny organisasjon for å drive prosjektet tidlegare kalla
“Centralize Bergen”. Den formelt ansvarlige søkar var Flaggfabrikken Senter for Samtidskunst. Prosjektet er i si
heilheit no overført til Aldea AS (ideellt aksjeselskap), og heiter “Aldea”. Vi ynskjer å signere
tildelingsbrev/akseptskjema med denne oppdaterte informasjonen:

Aldea AS
Strandgaten 55
5004 Bergen

Organisasjonsnummer: 918504176
Kontonummer: 15038621960

Kan dykk sende akseptskjema på nytt med oppdatert informasjon slik at vi får signert med riktig informasjon?
Enten til addressa over eller til e-post cameron.mac@gmail.com. Vi har ikkje signert akseptskjema vi opprinnelig
fekk då vi ville vente til vi hadde dette på plass. Kva er så prosedyren for å få pengar på konto? 

På førehand mange takk!

Beste Helsing

Magnhild Øen Nordahl, Cameron MacLeod
Aldea AS
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